
Extracts from Labour’s Manifesto

Our commitment to the UK’s nuclear deterrent is absolute.

It is a vital safeguard for the UK and our NATO allies. As the party that 
founded NATO, we maintain our unshakeable commitment to the alliance, 
and we will apply a NATO test to major defence programmes to ensure we 
meet our obligations in full.


The damage done by 14 years of chaotic ‘sticking plaster’ policies was 
exposed when Putin invaded Ukraine. The cost of fossil fuel energy on the 
international market rocketed. The Conservatives’ ban on new onshore wind, 
failure to build new nuclear power stations, and decision to scrap investment 
in home insulation landed British families with amongst the highest energy 
bills in Europe. That is just one way we are paying the price. While countries 
around the world are racing ahead to claim the jobs

The clean energy transition represents a huge opportunity to generate 
growth, tackle the cost-of-living crisis and make Britain energy independent 
once again and wealth that the transition offers, Britain is losing out.

But it is not too late to stop the chaos and turn the page.

We have tremendous untapped advantages: our long coast- line, high winds, 
shallow waters, universities, and skilled offshore workforce combined with 
our extensive technological and engineering capabilities. With a serious 
industrial strategy and a genuine partnership between the public and private 
sectors,

 

Nuclear power. We will ensure the long-term security of the sector, extending 
the lifetime of existing plants, and we will get Hinkley Point C over the line. 
New nuclear power stations, such as Sizewell C, and Small Modular 
Reactors, will play an important role in helping the UK achieve energy 
security and clean power while securing thousands of good, skilled jobs.


Our commitment to NATO as the cornerstone of European and global 
security is unshakeable.


Strengthening Britain’s security requires a long-term partnership with our 
domestic defence industry. Labour will bring forward a defence industrial 
strategy aligning our security and economic priorities. We will ensure a 
strong defence sector and resilient supply chains,

At the heart of our security are the men and women who serve and risk their 
lives for this country. We will strengthen support for our Armed Forces 
communities including steel, across the whole of the UK. We will establish

long-term partnerships between business and government, promote 
innovation, and improve resilience. We will prioritise UK businesses for 
defence investment and will reform procurement to reduce waste. Labour 
will support industry to benefit from export opportunities,

in line with a robust arms export regime committed to upholding international 
law.
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Labour is fully committed to AUKUS, the trilateral security partnership with 
Australia and the United States. We will ensure it delivers its full economic as 
well as security potential, increasing jobs and investment in communities 
across the UK.


Long-term peace and security in the Middle East will be an immediate focus. 
Labour will continue to push for an immediate ceasefire, the release of all 
hostages, the upholding of international law, and a rapid increase of aid into 
Gaza. Palestinian statehood is the inalienable right of the Palestinian people. 
It is not in the gift of any neighbour and is also essential to the long-term 
security of Israel. We are committed to recognising a Palestinian state

as a contribution to a renewed peace process which results in a two-state 
solution with a safe and secure Israel alongside a viable

and sovereign Palestinian state.


